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ALCOHOL AND MARIJUANA CONTROL OFFICE 

550 West 7th Avenue, Suite 1600 
Anchorage, AK 99501 

Main: 907.269.0350 
 
 

 

MEMORANDUM 

TO:        Alcoholic Beverage Control Board  
 

DATE:  July 9, 2019 

FROM: Erika McConnell, Director 
 

RE:  527 The Moose Creek Lodge 

 
Requested 
Action: 

License renewal 

  
Statutory  
Authority: 

AS 04.06.090(b):  “The board shall review all applications for licenses made under this title 
and may order the director to issue, renew, revoke, transfer, or suspend licenses and 
permits authorized under this title.” 
 
AS 04.11.480(a): “A local governing body may protest the issuance, renewal, relocation, or 
transfer to another person of a license by sending the board and the applicant a protest 
and the reasons for the protest within 60 days of receipt from the board of notice of filing 
of the application… The board shall consider a protest and testimony received at a 
hearing conducted under AS 04.11.510(b)(2) or (4) when it considers the application… If 
an application or continued operation is protested, the board shall deny the application or 
continued operation unless the board finds that the protest is arbitrary, capricious, and 
unreasonable.” 
 
AS 04.11.510(b)(2): “The board may review an application for the issuance, renewal, 
transfer of location, or transfer to another person of a license without affording the 
applicant notice or hearing, except…(2) the board may, on its own initiative or in response 
to an objection or protest, hold a hearing to ascertain the reaction of the public or a local 
governing body to an application if a hearing is not required under this subsection;” 

  
 
Update: At the last meeting, the board voted to uphold the protest and deny the renewal with 
abeyance to the next meeting, and asked for information regarding the judgment mentioned by the 
Borough. At the April meeting, the Fairbanks North Star Borough asserted that taxes began to be 
delinquent starting in 2014, that the licensee had entered into a Confession of Judgment with the 
Borough, that the licensee had breached the Confession of Judgment, and that the Borough went to 
court and got a court judgment to collect the money owed. 
 
Various court documents have been provided. 
 
In accordance with 3 AAC 304.145(h), the abeyance period granted at the last meeting may not be 
extended or renewed. 



527 The Moose Creek Lodge 
ABC Board July 9, 2019 
Page 2  
 
 
Background:  The Fairbanks North Star Borough protests the renewal of this license pending 
payment of taxes.  
 
 
Attachment: Fairbanks North Star Borough protest & supplemental documentation 
  Renewal application 



Fairbanks North Star Borough Mayor's Office 
907 Terminal Street P.O. Box 71267 Fa irbanks, AK 99707-1267 T.(907)459-1300 F.(907)459-1102 

MEM OR AN D UM 

TO: Alaska Alcoholic Beverage Control Board 

FROM: Jim Williams, Chief of Staff (\ . .J 
Fairbanks North Star Borough~ 

SUBJECT: Protest of Liquor License #527 

DATE: March 1, 2019 

The Fairbanks North Star Borough has conducted an investigation and determined that the applicant 
for License #527 has delinquent borough taxes. The Fairbanks North Star Borough is therefore 
protesting the renewal of the following liquor license pursuant to FNSBC 9.08.020: 

Beverage Dispensary - License #527 

H54B, Inc. 
DBA: The Moose Creek Lodge 
Location: 3560 Old Richardson Hwy 

North Pole, Alaska 99705 

The applicant has been provided written notice of this protest. 

/km 
cc: Concerned Licensee 

Assembly 

Received by AMCO 3.1.19



Annmarie Billingsley
Assistant Borough Attorney
Fairbanks North Star Borough
PO Box 71267
Fairbanks, Alaska 99707
Email: abillingsley@fnsb.us
Ph. (907) 459-1318
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I N THE DISTRICT COURT FOR THE STATE OF ALASKA

FOURTH JUDICIAL DISTRICT AT FAIRBANKS

FAIRBANKS NORTH STAR BOROUGH,

Plaintiff,

vs.
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H54B, INC. dba MOOSE CREEK LODGE
and MELANIE C. JORDAN,

Defendants.
ase No. 4FA-18-01252 CI

CONFESSION OF JUDGMENT

Defendants Melanie C. Jordan aka Melanie C. White and H54B, Inc. dba Moose

Creek Lodge hereby confess judgment in favor of the Plaintiff in the principal amount of

$36,643.90, plus accrued interest in the amount of $13,463.52, plus penalties in the

amount of $56,873.71, plus future interest at the rate of 15% per annum. This

indebtedness is based upon alcohol beverage taxes accrued between May 2014 and

October 2018. A printout of the current amounts due and owing is attached as Exhibit 1

and attested to by the FNSB Treasury and Budget Manager.

The amount confessed to is presently past due. Defendants hereby

acknowledge the debt is justly due and owing, delinquent and subject to immediate

FNSB v. H548, Inc. dba Moose Creek Lodge and Melanie C. Jordan; 4FA-18-01252CI
Confession of Judgment
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collection by Plaintiff. Defendants represent and agree that they are not entitled to any

~ type of credit, counterclaim or defense to offset the amount for which judgment is

hereby confessed other than future payments made on the amount presently past due.

The parties agree that Plaintiff will file this Confession of Judgment with the court

and, as a result of such filing, a judgment will be entered and recorded against

Defendants. However, the FNSB will not execute on the judgment unless Defendants

default on the following payment schedule:

Commencing on or before December 1, 2018, and on the 1St day of each month
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~ thereafter, Defendants shall pay to Plaintiff no less than $3,000.00 per month until the

~ full amount of the Judgment is paid. Payment in cash or certified funds only is to be

made to the Fairbanks North Star Borough. Payments shall be credited to the most

delinquent monthly report, first to penalties, then interest, then principal of any

unremitted taxes. Defendants shall deliver payments in the amount specified above no

later than the first day of each month to:

Fairbanks North Star Borough
Treasury/Budget Division
907 Terminal Street
Fairbanks, AK 99701

In addition to the $3,000.00 monthly payments, Defendants agree to stay current

on their monthly filings and remittances of taxes on ongoing alcoholic beverage sales

beginning with the November 2018 filing and payment due December 15, 2018.

Defendants' failure to strictly comply with this payment schedule ("Defendants'

default") shall be established by affidavit of Plaintiff. If the Defendants fail to file a

monthly report pursuant to FNSBC 8.52.100(B), fail to remit collected taxes pursuant to

FNSBC 8.52.100(A), or fail to submit the $3,000 monthly payment described above, the

FNSB v. H54B, Inc. dha Moose Creels Lodge and Melanie C. Jordan; 4FA-18-0125X1
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Plaintiff shall consider the Defendants in default. Should Defendants default, the entire

principal amount of Defendants' indebtedness, plus penalties, interest, less any

payments made, shall be immediately due and payable, and Plaintiff shall then be

entitled to obtain a Writ of Execution without notice to Defendants or a hearing.

In the event of Defendants' default, Plaintiff may also collect any additional costs

and attorney fees incurred in connection with any collection efforts in this matter.

In the event Defendants move or leave the State of Alaska, they agree to notify

Plaintiff in writing of their new address and phone number.

DATED this day of ~~Q,~wL~ , 2018.
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MELANIE C. JOR AN aka MELANIE C. WHITE
Alaska Driver's Li ease No. (~0~'(0~`~7
Date of Birth: ~~~C~I~~

STATE OF ALASKA )

)§
FOURTH JUDICIAL DISTRICT

THIS IS TO CERTIFY that on this ~~~ day of ~~2~.p,.vv~~ , 2018,

before me, the undersigned Notary Public in and for the State of Alaska, duly

commissioned and sworn, personally appeared MELANIE C. JORDAN aka MELANIE

C. WHITE, individually and on behalf of H54B, Inc. dba Moose Creek Lodge, known to

me to be the identical individual mentioned herein and who executed the within

document, and Sh~~acknowledged to me that she signed the same freely and voluntarily,,~~

for the us~~ncf purposes ~J~erein mentioned.

~~ ~ ~ ~iG

~a ~°•'e~~ ~ Notary Public in and for AI ka
+'e~~̀

1 e01~ ~~`°~ Commission Expires:
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ACKNOWLEDGMENT AND VERIFICATION

STATE OF ALASKA )

)§
FOURTH JUDICIAL DISTRICT )

MELANIE C. JORDAN aka MELANIE C. WHITE, individually and on behalf of
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H54B, Inc. dba Moose Creek Lodge, upon oath, deposes and says: I am the Defendant

in the foregoing matter; I know the contents of the Confession of Judgment and believe

the same to be true and just; there are no offsets or credits due me and I authorize

judgment to be given against me in the principal amount of $36,643.90, plus accrued

interest in the amount of $13,463.52, plus penalties in the amount of $56,873.71, plus

future interest at the rate of 15% per annum, plus attorney fees and costs.

DATE LANIE C. JORD N aka MELANIE C. WHITE

SUBSCRIBED AND SWORN TO BEFORE ME on this day of
~~1~Vv~,l~- , 2 018 .

~<~
Notary Public in and for Alaska
Commission Expires: ~ ~ 2.C~
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ASSENT

Plaintiff FAIRBANKS NORTH STAR BOROUGH, by and through its undersigned

counsel, hereby accepts the foregoing Confession of Judgment by MELANIE C.

JORDAN aka MELANIE C. WHITE, individually and on behalf of H54B, Inc. dba Moose

Creek Lodge.

DATED this ~~h day of ~ ,~~~ , 2018.
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FAIRBANKS NORTH STAR BOROUGH

__-~____w~.

Annmarie Billingsley
Assistant Borough Attorney
ABA No. 1011059

STATE OF ALASKA )

FOURTH JUDICIAL DISTRICT )

The foregoing instrument was acknowledged before me this ~'~~ day of

~~ ~Q~,~~~~ ;~ , 2018, by the above-named individual with authority to do so

as the attorney of record for the Plaintiff.

d~~Yg tae

:~ R

otary Public i nd for Alaska
Commission Expires: p~~ ~ a~ ~ ~~~~q
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FW RBANHS NORTH STAR HOAO UGH
T72EASURYAND BUDGET OMSION
D09 PIONEER ROAD
PD 8oX 7732U
FAIRBANKS, ALASKA 99]Ol t]20
(90~ 459.14EJ

ALCOHOLIC H6VE{iA6ETAX REPORT

Acwunt No. ]~t11T

Business HSdB INC dba Moose Creek Lodge ~vj'7

For the Tlmo Frame aC 5(14-TO/18 Monthly RcporUng ~~~ ii

Tnc above (cvun s csCmamtl tar the to lowlnp maon(s

No Payment:
Tax Cue mLelculaictl
Incomolecc Irtformatlon

Raport fllad nttcr duo date

NSF Gheck

x omer. Figures valid un5l 'IZl'ISNB Prcvlou.ly protected thN 1'1175/18

YOUR REPORT HAS SEEN ESTIMATED AS FOIIOWS:

1. G0.055 ALCOHOLIC BEVERAGE SALES (ctim~todJ~VERA

2 ~EtdPT SPLES PURSUANT TO BOROUG4 CODE ~S9.Od0.8

3. SUHTRACT UNE 2 FROM17 LJNE t

4. MULTIPLY UNE38Y 5~(LINE3X.0~

SALES TAxFS PAID aN THE S:.L.ES IN UNE7 TO ANY AtUNICiPA1JTY WRHIN
5 THE 2oft000H (athch documantatian)

StIHTRACT LINE5FR00 LINE4 (SEES/~9/'I6 COMMENT)6.

7. PENALTIES A 10%T~%~UE ar 55o far:ero 6alanec repor's

8. ad itiorc~I Late ReparUUte Remit Penalty (LS%of TAX DUE]

G Additlowl Lnlo RopoWLalo Remit Panaly 5700400 aftor 60 day:

D. NSF FEE

8, INiEReST-1.759: (.0175 xLINE 6J pormonth

9. LJABILRY FOR Fll1NG P'cWOD (Lino 6+lino TA+ono B~

10. MINUS CRElllT OR ADD OIITSTFN0ING LIABILITY

10. REVISED N=7 TAXE5➢UE

~A~v-14 Jun-ta Jui-14 Auq-14 Sep-'14 Oct-14 Nov-14 Dec-14 Jan-t5 Feb-'IS Mzr-15 Apr-15 May-TS Jun-15

5 30,4D0.~0 5 2'I A06.00 S '16.d3'I.00 5 23,801.00 5 13,533.00 5 77,80D.00 5 t6,83H.00 5 74,641.00 5 71,39200 5 9506.00 5 OAO 5 7,743.50 S 74.SZ4.50 S 2577200

S 0.00 S 0_oU 5 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.00 5 O.UO 5 0.00 S 0.00 5 0.00 5 0110 5 O.OD S OAo S 0.00 S O.OU

30,dD0.00 21,006.00 16,43'1.00 2:1,80'1.00 13,533.OU 17,800.00 16,838.00 14,64'IAU 7'1,392.00 9,906.00 O.OD 7,145.50 74.824.50 25,71200

5 1,520.00 S '1.U50.30 5 82'ISS 5 1,'19.05 S 676.65 5 890.00 5 84'1.90 5 72245 S 569.60 5 d95.3U S O.OU 5 35728 5 74~2:i 5 1.265.60

5 0.00 S 0.00 5 O.GO 5 0.00 S 0.00 5 4.00 S 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.00 5 OAU 5 0.00 5 DAD 5 O.OD

1,520.00 1,050.30 82'fS5 1,190.05 676.65 890.00 84190 722.05 569.60 495.30 0.00 35728 74723 1.285.60

75200 ~D5.03 8276 1!9.01 67.67 89.00 Sd.19 7211 5656 4953 50.00 35.73 74.12 128.56

5 384.00 5 26258 5 205.39 5 29751 5 769.16 5 Z225D S 210.48 5 '180St 5 '14240 S '123.83 $ 0.00 5 89.32 5 185.31 5 32'I.SO

5 1.000.00 5 1.000.00 5 1,000.00 5 'I,000.DU S 1,000.00 5 1,400.00 5 7 000.00 S '1.~~0.00 3 1.000.00 S 7.000.00 S 7,D~0.00 5 'I.000AO 5 'I,000AD 5 1 000.00

5 aO.UD 5 0.00 5 D.00 3 0.00 5 0.00 S 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.00 S 4-DD 5 0.00 5 O.Oa 5 0.00 S 0.00 S 0.00

5 780.5] 5 676.01 5 534.01 5 758.66 S 42291 5 545.T3 5 505.14 5 42420 5 327.52 5 278.61 S 0.00 5 19204 5 389.15 5 658.87

'1,674.373,86211 3,09352 1,643.10 3,36522 2.336.38 2.765.63 2.64~.7~ 2.398.97 2,096.48 1,94726 1,050.00 2.389.87 3,394.43

S 0.00 5 O.DO S 0.00 S 0.00 5 OAO 5 0.00 5 0.00 S 400 S O.OD 5 O.OD 5 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.00 S o.00

5 3,86251 5 3,09352 S 2,643.'10 5 3,165?Z 5 2,336.38 5 2.746-63 S 2.641.7'1 5 2,398.97 5 2.096.f8 5 1,9¢7.26 5 i,oso.aa 5 1.fi7437 S 2,389-8t 5 3,394.43

1t2Vi8 Raftl ooh pymi of W9A4 ryt/i5f:8f,adJ~-eM 15o1Won betltl N~wrt of 5599, Mntl➢oi bolvneefatJun 14~
~1/2'~/2108 7eld,ln(ereRaccutvl l¢.1b~01E not uptlrtet SolWon tof lnte~eataf i.l:.

'1024/2098 ~pdat~ figure: to reflect pr jeetion thru'I'Vt5M8 June ~4'urter~s[ increased by 5559, DiQ not update One SofuCon

10!75/20'18 Received a payment of 5564.10 applied towards Junc 2014 baWncc, princ(pai 6afanrn Is 5478.88,

.~ ~m.m~.m.......w. 10/08/18: ftecelvcdapaymerd otS3,0~0.00, app11e0 S955S'I Sowards MAY 2094 WIanee and 52,oa4.49 towards theJvne 2o~a balance

cf-. oy ~ ~ ~ Traasurery Aaalxmntl0udpvt TacnNGan

Onte

Exhibit 1,~~~~age 1 of 3



FAIRBANKS NORTH STAR eOROIIGN
'TREASURY ANO eIIDGET DIVISION
809 710NEER ROAD
PD BOX Ii]2~
FllR9ANIC5, ALASKA 99i 071320
(907j d59-idll

JanuaryAICOHOIJC BEVvZAGETAX REPORT 1• I964
Accvun[Na. JOtt17

Buslnc-.s HSdB INC dba Moose Crcck Lvdpc
••

For Mc Tlme Fnmc oi: 5/1¢10/18 Monthly Reportlng

The aEove rctum s 4LrtutcE for Mc toilowlnq fcuon s~: -

No Paymenu
Tax duc mtscalculatcd
InwmPiete Ir~fOfmatlOn
ReOoM1 (Iced after due date

NSF Chcck

X ONer. n~,,,...,na ~Nu a ria for ma,,,y Prevlousry pr )eeted Mru ~ Vl5/7a for all v'hcr montRs

YOUR RE➢ORT HAS BEEN ESTidATE~ AS FOLLOWS:

'mate E:~matc Estimate Actual E^Lmztc Fsvmaic Es9mate Est~matc EsGma[e mate E-Crtwte Esvmate E. mafe -mm~c ^nmatc E^hma

Jul-15 Auq-15 Sep-75 Oct-15 - Nov-15 Dec-75 Jan-16 Feb-16 Ma-16 Apr-16 May-76 Jun-16 Jul-16 Auq-16 Sep-16 OeF16 Nov-16 Dec-16 Jan-17 Feb-'17 Mar-t7 Aprv17

5 ~5,59t.00 S 23,245.00 S 70.448.25 S 17,100.00 5 7,685.00 $ 12.52425 5 '1'1,39200 5 9 06.00 5 8,525.75 5 8,'IG0.00 5 '14,82CS0 S 25.7'1200 5 75,591.00 23,245.00 S "10,44825 S l7,10D.00 5 7.685.00 5 '12,52025 5 11.39200 5 9.906,00 5 8.525.75 s s.~aa.00

S 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.00 S OAO S 0.00 S D.00 5 0.0~ S 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.~0 5 O.UD S D.00 0.00 S 0.00 S 0.00 $ 0.00 5 6.00 5 x.00 5 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.00

X5,597.00 23,245.00 'I O,G4825 17,100.00 7.685.00 72,52425 11,392.00 9506.00 8,525.75 8,140.00 ~d,826.50 25,T12D0 'ISS9'I.00 23,245.00 'IO,dC825 '1710U.00 7,685,00 i2S2<-25 11,392.00 9.906.00 8,525.7$ 8,140.60

5 779.55 5 1.76225 5 SZZG'1 S 855.00 5 38625 5 62621 5 569.60 5 495.30 S 42629 5 407.00 5 74123 S 1285.60 5 T/9S5 1,16225 S 522.4'1 5 855.OD 5 38025 S 62621 S 569.60 S 495.30 5 426.29 5 d07A0

5 0.00 5 o.0a 5 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.00 S ~,a~ 5 0.00 S 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.00 D.Ov 5 0.00 5 OAO S O.OD S 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.00

779.55 1,16225 522.1'1 855A0 38425 626.2'1 569.60 495.30 62629 d07.0~ 74123 '1,265.60 779.55 1,'16225 522.b1 855.00 38425 6262'1 569.60 495.30 42629 d07A0

77.96 11613 5224 8530 38.x3 62.62 5636 4953 6263 40.70 70.12 128.56 7756 71623 5224 85.50 38.63 6262 5636 49.53 02,63 60.70

5 194.89 S 290.56 5 130.60 5 273.75 5 96A6 5 15fi.55 5 142-40 5 123.83 § 106.57 5 107.75 S 185.37 5 32'1.4D 5 794.89 29056 § 130.60 5 2'tA75 S 96A6 S 156.55 5 14240 5 123•&? 5 tO6S7 S 10175

S 1.000.00 5 1,000.00 5 'I,OoOAo 5 1.Oa0.0o S 1.000.00 5 7.000.00 S 1.000.00 5 '1,000.0 5 1,000.00 5 'I.oao.00 $ 1,000.00 5 7 000.00 5 7,400.00 'I,000.0~ S 7.000.00 5 1,000.00 5 0.00 S 1.000.00 S 1,000.00 5 1.000.00 S 1.000.00 5 1,000.00

5 0.00 5 0.~0 S 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.0o O.OD 5 D.~O 5 0.00 5 0.00 5 OAO S U.00 S 0.0~ 5 0.00 5 x.00

5 389.78 5 566.60 5 268.14 5 395.E4 5 17251 5 27357 5 262u8 5 204.31 S 170.52 5 '157.71 5 277.96 5 4b6.03 5 272.8< 39226 5 169.78 5 267.19 S 11518 5 ieO.Ob 5 156.64 S 730.02 S 106.57 S 96.66

2.662.17 3,135.63 1,953.b0 2.549.69 7.69].65 2,1'19.35 2.07'I.Od 1.87297 1,7dS.0'1 x,707.16 2,278.62 320'IS9 2,32524 2,96'1.30 1,875.04 1,62'1.41 634.0'1 2,025.42 1525.60 7798.6! 1,68206 1,646.~i

5 0.00 S OAU 5 0.00 5 x.00 5 OAO 5 0.00 5 0.00 5 DAO S 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.00 5 OAO S 4.00 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.00 S 0.~0 5 O.OD S 0.00 5 0.00 5 U.00 S 0.00

5 2,442'17 5 3,135.63 5 1,953.40 5 2.569.69 5 t.69'I.65 S 2,119.35 5 2.411.04 5 1.87297 5 1,746.01 5 1.707.16 S 2,278.62 5 3z0~.59 S 2.32524 2,961.30 S 7.875.06 S 2.42'1.64 5 63G.01 5 2.025.42 S 1525.60 5 1.798.67 5 7,68206 5 1,645.17

5 0.00 S x.00 S 0.00 S 0.00 S 0.00 S 0.00 S a.OD 5 0.00 5 x.00 5 0.00 5 O.OD S 0.00 5 ~.OU 0.0~ 5 0.00 5 0 00 S 0 DO 5 0 00 S 0 00 5 0 00 5 0 00 5 0 DD

2 C62~7 3135.63 1953.4D 2,549.69 169765 2179.35 20~i 0< 187257 176601 170716 2,27862 3201.59 2,32524 2,96t.30 187504 242746 63407 2,02542 192560 17986! 168206 1646
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FAIR9ANK5 NORTH STAR HDAOfIGH
TREASURY t.~'D 6l1DGET ONISION
609 PIONEER ROAD
PO 80X 7'1120
FILLRBANKS, ALASKA 99701 t]2o
(9~~ 459-1441

ALCOHOUG BEVERAGE TpX REPORT Jai teary

Acmant No. ~

eusinrs

For 14e Time Frvmc oC 5'14-'10(78 Mantlity neporting

No PaymenC
Tu duc miscaleuW[ed
Incomokm IMortnaHon
Report fllatl nY.er Gue dnty

NSF Ghcck

X Othcr. ~o,.......,,~n nnv~. i...,v w, Prevlotu-~y proftttcd thN 11175/18 fara0 other months

YOUR REPORT HAS BEEN ESi1MATE0 AS FOLLOWS:

Esvmate Esnm~te Estlmate EsLmate E^.amam -nm~te Estmate E~Lmate Estimate Estimate sumate Estmate stimate nrnwtiiacnu arnui»r_cne

Jun 20tH AUBtH n..w scpie m.0 OGT'IB r,n,u

Mav-17 Jun-17 JuI-17 Aua-17 Sep-77 Oct-17 Nov-17 Oea'17 Jan-18 Feb-18 Marv78 Apr-18 MAY-18 tl Jul-78 ~ ~ ~ Grand Tonis

5 14,8X.50 $ 25,712.00 5 15,591.00 S 23,245.00 S 10,44825 S 17,100.00 5 7.685.00 5 12,52415 5 1'1,39200 S 9,906.00 S 8,525.75 S 8,140.90 S ~4.ffi4S0 5 10,07750 5 0.00 S 9.8'IO.OD 17,ZBZ00 8,96925 $ 732,878.00

s o.00 s o.ao s o.o~ s o.ao s o.00 s o.00 s o.oa 5 0.0o s o.o0 5 a.00 s o.aa s o.00 s n.00 s o.00 s o.00 s o.00 o.00 o.00 s o.00

14,82d.50 25,77200 15,591.00 23,245.00 ~O,G4825 17,100.00 7,685.00 12,52425 '17,392.00 9.906.00 8,525.75 8,'160.00 14,824.50 10,077.50 0.00 9,810.00 71282.00 8,96925 732,878.00

5 74723 5 '1,285.60 S 779.55 5 1,16225 5 52ZGt 5 835.00 5 384.25 5 6261'1 5 569.60 5 695.30 5 42629 5 407.00 5 74123 5 500.88 5 0.00 S 490.50 564.-10 <48.G4 5 36,64350

5 0.00 5 0.00 S 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.00 5 x.00 S 0.00 5 x.00 5 O.OU 5 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.00 5 U.00 S 0.~0 5 0.~0 0.0~ 0.00 5 U.00

74113 '1285.60 77955 1.'16225 522.67 855.00 38425 62527 569.60 49530 426.29 SD7.OD 74123 50 .88 0.00 490.50 564.10 448.34 36,663.90

7C.'12 728.56 77.96 71623 SZZ4 85.50 38.43 6262 5696 49.53 42.63 40.70 76.2 50.09 0,00 49.05 56.41 44.80 3.714.39

S 185.37 5 32'1.60 S ~9E.89 5 290.56 5 130.60 S 213.75 S 96.06 5 '(8685 5 '1424D 5 '(23.83 $ '106.57 5 701.75 S '(8531 S 725?2 5 0.00 $ 72263 '(41.03 0.00 5 9.048.87

5 1,000.00 S 1.000.00 5 'I.000.OU 5 1.000AO 5 1.00.00 5 1.000.00 5 7.000.00 5 'I,000AO 5 ~A~0,00 5 1,000AO S 7,000AO 5 'I A0~.00 S 'I AOOAD 5 'I,000AO 5 1.000.00 S 'I.000AO O.DO 0.00 5 51,000.00

5 0.00 S 0.00 5 0.00 5 x.00 S O.UO S 0.00 S 0.00 S 0.00 S 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.00 S 0.00 5 0.00 5 OAO 5 0.00 0.00 0.00 5 3U.OU

5 166.78 5 27].9 S ~555'I S 217.92 5 97.42 S 73856 5 57.64 5 86.10 5 7120 5 55.72 S 4263 5 35.61 S 55.59 5 31.3 5 0.00 S '1839 14.70 5.61 5 73.46352

2,767.66 3,008.75 2.20830 2.786.96 1.796.68 2,293.19 7,576.38 783'1.69 '1,840_'16 1.724.38 1,6'!8.'12 1.585.06 2.05625 1,707.49 ~,000.00 'I,68D.57 775.66 498.89 7'13.9D0.67

s o.oa s a.00 s o.00 s o.00 s o.00 s o.00 s a.00 s o.00 s o.00 s o.o0 5 a.on s o.00 s o.00 s o.00 s o.ao s o.00 a.00 o.aa s a.00

5 2,'167.44 5 3,008.75 5 2.208.30 5 2,78656 S 1.796.68 5 2,293.79 5 1,576.38 5 '1,937.49 5 1.840.16 5 '1.72438 5 7.618.72 S 1 5.06 5 1.05625 S 7,707.49 S 7.000.00 S ! 680.57 775.64 493.89 5 '1'13500.67

5 OAO 5 0.00 S 0.00 S 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.00 5 ~.0a 5 0.00 5 4.00 5 D.00 5 0.00 5 0.00 S 0.00 5 4.00 5 U.00 5 0.00 0.00 0.00 5 ~6,9t9.55

2,'167.44 3,008.75 2,208.30 2,78656 1 796.68 2,293A9 1.576.38 7.931.49 1,840.16 '1726.38 1,618.'12 1,585.06 2,05625 1,707.49 7,000.00 1.68057 775.64 498.89 5106,982.12
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Annmarie Billingsley
Assistant Borough Attorney
Fairbanks North Star Borough
PO Box 71267
Fairbanks, Alaska 99707
Email: abiilingsley@fnsb.us
Ph. (907) 459-1318

I N THE SUPERIOR COURT FOR THE STATE OF ALASKA

FOURTH JUDICIAL DISTRICT AT FAIRBANKS

FAIRBANKS NORTH STAR BOROUGH,

Plaintiff,

vs.

an
0
~ o 00o ~ ~
~ a ~ a

~ ~~~~~ ~ ~
~ o d o

o ~~~~
Z ~O~ ;;
~ ~~~ o
~ A .~ .~
~ w a
.,,
w

H54B, INC. dba MOOSE CREEK LODGE
and MELANIE C. JORDAN,

Defendants.

Case No. 4FA-18-01252 CI

FAIRBANKS NORTH STAR BOROUGH'S MOTION FOR ENTRY OF JUDGMENT
AND ATTORNEY'S FEES

COMES NOW, Plaintiff, Fairbanks North Star Borough ("FNSB"), hereby moves

this court for entry of judgment pursuant to the confession of judgment which was filed

on December 12, 2018. The Confession of Judgment specifies that "the parties agree

I~ that Plaintiff will file this Confession of Judgment with the court and, as a result of such

filing, a judgment will be entered and recorded against Defendants."' H54B, Inc. dba

Moose Creek Lodge and Melanie Caroline Jordan nka Melanie Caroline White (DOB:

02/10/1976) (hereinafter "Defendants") failed to comply with the Confession of

Judgment, making only two partial payments after the confession of judgment was

See Confession of Judgment at p. 2.

FNSB's Motion for Entry of Judgment and Attorney's Fees
FNSB v. H548, Inc. dba Moose Creek Lodge and Melanie C. Jordan; 4FA-18-01252 CI
Page 1 of 2



signed.2 The FNSB subsequently updated the Alcoholic Beverage Tax Report, attached
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as Exhibit 1, incorporated the two partial payments, and has lodged a corresponding

proposed final judgment contemporaneously herewith.

The FNSB is also requesting attorney's fees. Under Civil Rule 82(b)(1), "a party

recovering a money judgment in a case... [n]on-contested" receives 10% on the first

$25,Q00 of the judgment, 3% on the next $75,000 of the judgment, and 2% on the next

$400,000. The monetary judgment received is $105,343.29. Here, 10% on $25,000 is

$2,500.00, 3% on $75,000.00 is $2,250.00, and 2% on $5,343.30 is $106.87, for a total

of $4,856.87 in attorney's fees. The FNSB respectfully requests that the Court issue this

amount as the appropriate fee award in addition to costs in the amount of $411.50, as

shown on the Cost Bill lodged contemporaneously herewith.

DATED this ~C.~ day of January, 2019.

FAIRBANKS NORTH STAR BOROUGH

~Zc.

Annmarie Billingsley
Assistant Borough Attorney
Alaska Bar No. 1011059

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE
This is to certify that on this date, a copy
of the foregoing is being:
.mailed via first class mail, o faxed or

❑ hand delivered to the following
attorney or parties of record:

Jason A. Weiner
Gazewood &Weiner, PC
1008 16~h Avenue, Suite 200
Fairbanks, Alaska 99701

~, . , ~~, .
FNSB Department of Law

-1`~
Date

2 See Affidavit of Peggy Macdonald at ¶5, lodged contemporaneously herewith

FNSB's Motion for Entry of Judgment and Attorney's Fees
FNSB v. H548, Inc, dba Moose Creek Lodge and Melanie C. Jordan; 4FA-18-01252 CI
Page 2 of 2



FNR9gNN5 NORTH STAR BORO~ON
TA@ASISRY AND BII~ULT ~NIs~ON
eoB PIONEER ftoM
P090S11~30

~ ~7}46B-1U] 
KA BB]Ol tY10 Ja _

~~arY 1' 1
ALCOHOLC HEVEgAaETA%ftEPORf 964

Account Na. ~01ttT - ~

Bwlnen HS~B WCdba Meocs Creekl.odpo ~•

PorN.~imv Fr.me ur. 61147?HB Monfily ftepoMng

au em[um .a mri br efo ow oa m~man e:

No Peymmtr
TazdYo mbwlauleted
Incamplvly fnfatmatfan
_RepeRAlad merdwd~G

NSFch~k

_~( Olher. Flgurosvelld uN00]l16M9 PravloualyprvJcclod 1hN 01t1W'IB

Y011RRCPOAT HA9 BEFN E9fIMATEV AS FOLLOWS:

MaV-ib Jun-tb Juf•14 Aup•14 Sop-04 Oct-04 Nov-14 DocAb JanAS Fobdb Mor-15 Apt-ti MnyAS Jun-15

1. GROS6ALCOfI0t1C9EVE7tAGE SALES (617maled) S 30,400.00 S 21 006.00 $ 'I6.dJ1.00 S ~.84'1AU s ~a.saa.ao $ 17.BU0.00 5 16,838.00 5 1d.dN.00 S 1'1.~92U0 $. 9,9U6.00 S 0.00 5 7.146.fi0 5 t4.82b.60 S Td.77200

2 E7~iPT6AI.ESPUfi6UANfi0 BOft00CH C00E]SAO/O.B S 0.00 S 6.04 S 0.00 S OAO S OAO $ 0.00 j U.00 5 OAU $ OAO 5 0.00 S OAU S OAO $ 0.40 5 0.00

J. SUBTpACTtlHE2Fft01A tlNE7 ~0.400.OQ 21,OOB.UO 18,491.00 2J,80t.00 17,S~J.UO 77800.00 16.838.00 14441.06 11, 9200 9,808.00 0.00 7,'148.60 14.834.60 25,71200

4. MUL71PLYlJNE88Y5X (L11~3X.05) S 1.340.00 5 1ASO.JO 5 821.55 S 1.190.05 j 876.65 S 990,x0 S 84f.90 3 722A5 $ E68.8o 5 485.0 5 4.40 S 35/.28 $ 741.13 S 1.285.80

SNESTA~S PND ON7}IE SAES INCIHEt TOANY MUWdPALIfYKtTXiNTHE
5 BOROUGH (eWeh doamenbllon) $ 0.00 3 0.00 $ OAO $ 0.00 S 0.00 $ U.DO S O.OD S 0.00 5 0.00 j 0.00 5 0.00 $ 0.00 S 0.00 $ 0.00

B 5110T(tACTtIHESFIMM11tINE/ (SEE6N9118 COMMQJT) 1,620.00 t.osoao 821.55 1,180.05 676.65 880.00 841.80 722.05 b69.60 495.90 0,00 ~5T.2B 74~.ZJ 1.285.80

7. PENALTIESA tOS:TAY➢UEar534 (ormrohilanwre➢oAx 152.OD 105.09 8276 119.01 67.67 88.40 &1.19 7221 56.96 49.68 60.00 ~5.7~ 74.12 128.68

& AddNonal Lale AepalUlak RaMl PonaNy (]5%oITA%OVFa S 980.00 5 364b8 $ 405.38 S 187.51 S 169.16 5 22.60 S 210.48 $ i80.bt S 1d2d0 S tY~.B] S 0.00 $ 88.32 S '195.31 S 3MA0

C AddNa~allala pepolNsb Pemlt Pepalty {1000AO ailefba da)w 5 1.000.00 $ 1000.00 $ 1.000.00 $ 'I OOOAO 5 7,DU0.00 S 1,000.00 S 1.00D.00 $ 1.000AU 5 1.000.00 S 1.400,00 $ 1,000,00 S 1.000.00 S 1.000.0 1 Y,000.00

➢. NSFFEE $ H0.00 ; 0.00 5 0.00 $ OAD $ 0.00 5 0.00 5 ~•~a S 0.00 S 0.00 5 0.00 0,00 S 0.00 5 OAD S 0.00

d. INiERESf-tI55: (~i]Sxl1NE6~pormon9i $ 780.61 S B76.Ot S 546.88 3 788,41 S X9.82 3 567.]8 5 626.19 5 46226 5 X41.78 S 290.89 5 0.00 j 200.97 j 407.88 3 B91.Ot

9. UAB~L17yi0RfllJNaPFNO~~Uno6~ppe7A~llna8) 5862.61 1,09J.92 2,655.87 ~,JB6.8H Y,9i9.J0 3,788.88 2,888.75 2.477.02 ].11072 1,959.66 t,05U.00 1.6&1.0 4,408.4 9,42&61

14. hONUS CpE~~(ORM~OUfSfAN01lKi LUBIt1TY 5 0.00 5 o.no 5 0.00 S O.OD $ 0.00 S 0. 0 5 0.00 S 0.00 $ 0.00 S 0.00 $ 0.00 5 OAO j 0.00 j 0.00

10. flE'ASm NEf7A7~5UUE $ 3,86267. $ J.093.92 5 Y,fi55.97 S 3,7BQ.B8 5 2.53.30 S 2.768.88 5 3.66276 $ 2.417.02 5 z,++o•~z 5 1.859.64 5 1.050AU S 1.fi83.1D $ 2.408.74 $ ~.42fi.57

11. lESSPAYMRRe PEC~Y~ ; -~~Bfi2bt 5 JOB~.82 S 44&12 $ EAU 5 0.00 S 0.00 S 0,00 s o.o0 5 0.00 5 0.00 $ 0.00 S OAO S 0.00 S 0.00

6AI.ANCE DUE 0.00 0.00 210.85 J994.98 $J68.80 2,768.88 4,68275 2,4'17.04 2,110.72 1,959,84 ~,050.~6 1,88~.~0 2,008.36 ~~428.6/

tnartate
n.re. wr~mnnm i..w.in+.~aa~aamim....~ eni e,iw~.~rwrm.~..~.miran+n.

a]4 Luv.n~ewnl prmeMfiwlYb. ttAo.MUn.W 1eM ~da.d ~NrflteM~(erueh~tlal
nw~r.a»nao m ra i:oa inaao~.n~~wiw~.

menih
~••~,•••nn~wi~

n.~a..a.wm~~~=~Maao.oe. edlWw~e.~mm~i..da~ma..~,~aw.ucm.,w~.~ceoghaa...emxw u,nw~~.tamww~m.aaeix~mx....~aNmy~a

1P/17MUta
A IYt~~hi]b.iWY 14 TNCIpJ bJu~e.euta4Mrgl~f~ifAe.ndtlevAt nmJmaN.hMUganpivll~~+. We~W ~ewnl lM1roUltM~forJN
.e~ewm~a.rvn.n4

1[btl4v~sfmt

ts174f2ota n.rax~urwn.~a~ymu ~pdi•e...wh.

17M1YL108
mm~. woa...n am~.rw..0 autm+l..am.iw~ amw~
sotWon(a~M.er.MoltAa.

i.,aeim.,..i.riws~ nn~wiw w.w. ro..rvxu.aea.Jm....i.aw.d i.we, ma n.eupdn. t

t 01Rd/20t8 upda..nwn+mr.nwev~l.„~.n ~Iw HMeMe am.ulnt.r..ltr w.wuylase. ddnei~pn.a~usolwen

10~ib/1018 P~oa~wd.wYmNtalteuto .ogldlevnrJ.Jun. ]o116aluw.~wlnalyl Wl.M.1.t1tMe.
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FNP9ANK9 NORTN STAit 9oR000H
TfiEA511RY ANO BtI00ET ~MSION
e0B PIONEFJi Hopp
PO B0X 71J20
FAIRBANKS, pIg31(q BB70T 1920
~aml ~ssatu Ja~~a 1-.

ry 1964atcoHouceevainaeraz Revortr

Amount No. aa114 ~

Hux~ne~~ H6191Nc dbaM~~~C~nok Ledpe ~•

Far lea Tuna FremooC 6H411118 µo~lO~y RepaMing

a emum ra. mei on .m owing m.ron.:
No Pryulenb

_Tezduc mleoelaWeted
InwmO~eb Infaemsgon

_IUpertllW ~tdfda~Eda

NSF Chock

~athar. Fl9ums w1ltl unt001Fi6f19 Prevlou~Iy proJeateC ~~M tr7l16I18

YOUR FePaRT NA56eFN ESpMATPD As FOLLOWS;

moo mu a c mn o c ua ma a s ma n mn o s mn e s mo o ma o ma o s ma n mn n ~ma o ma a ma o

Jul-05 Aup•75 SnpAS Oc146 Nov-16 Doc-15 Jan-06 Poh-16 MuMfi Apnt6 May-08 Jun-0B JUI-16 Au4 ~6 Sup•'IB Oc618 Now16 Ooe-0B Jan•'I7 Feh-17 MaM7 APf-17

$ 16,691.00 S 3~.Zd3.00 S t0A48.25 S 17.1U0.00 S 7.885.00 j 12,52435 j '17.792A0 $ 8.908.00 j 8.646.76 $ 8140.00 5 14.824.50 $ 45,71200 $ 15.597.00 13.245.00 S '10,M816 S 17.100.00 $ 7,683.00 j 12.b24.26 S 7t,J820U j 8,806.00 S 8.525.75 $ 8,140.00

o.Ua ; o.00 ; 0.0o S OAO 5 o.ao $ 0.00 3 oAo S o,ao S 0.00 5 ~.ao ; o.oa 3 o.ao S o.00 o.ao i o.o0 5 0.0o j 0.00 ; o.ao S ooU j U.00 S 0.0o j o.oa

16,691.00 28,2d5.00 10 48.26 17,100A0 7,685.00 12,524.25 17 92ao 8.908.00 8,626.7b 8.'140.00 14.824.50 25,7'1200 15,591.00 21,245.OD '10,448.46 '17,740.~D 7,885.00 12.624.26 71.J9200 9,806.00 8,535.75 8,140.Oa

778.55 j 7.76225 5 614A'1 5 855.00 S ~BQ.RS $ 82627 3 569.60 $ 495.70 ; 426.89 5 407.00 5 741.71 j ~,YB5.80 5 779.65 t 16226 5 522.41 S 855.00 $ ]8635 f 826.21 S Sfi8.80 5 485.9 j 42839 j 407.00

S o.00 ; o.00 S o.0o S o.ao 5 0.00 ; 0.00 3 0.00 ; 0.0o S o.o0 5 0.00 5 0.0o S o.o0 5 0,00 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.00 ; o.ou = o.o0 5 0,00 ; o.ao S o.00 ; o.uo

T79S5 1,'181.25 52241 855.00 ~H4.ZS 818.21 669.60 495.J0 428.29 407.00 74123 1,885.80 779.65 1.78226 622.41 855,00 ]84.25 62827 569.60 /85.70 43619 d07.00

T/.B6 118.2] 6226 85.50 ~B.d] fi2.fi2 58.96 49.5 42.8 40.70 74.14 tI8.56 77.86 '1'162 51,24 BS,bO 98A~ 6282 68.96 49.6 4R.6J 40A0

j tB~,B9 j 2BU.56 $ 130.60 S 278.76 S BB.OB S 758.55 $ 7d2d0 5 1~.BJ S 1Ufi.9 $ 101.75 5 185.J7 5 721.40 5 194.89 290.68 5 '13U.fi0 5 27JT5 S 88.06 $ 156.55 5 '142.d0 5 12JAJ 3 'IU8.57 $ 707.76

S t,000A0 S 1.000.00 5 7.440.00 5 ~A~4•~0 5 1.000.00 S 1.440.00 5 1.000.00 S 1 000.00 S 1,000.00 $ 1,000.00 5 1.000.00 $ 1,000.00 S 1.440.00 ~,~00.00 5 1.000.00 S 1.000.00 S 0.00 $ tA00.00 5 1.440.00 S 7.400.0 5 t.000.0~ 5 1.000.00

S O.UU S 0.00 S O.OU S 0.00 S 0.00 S 0.00 5 0.00 S 0.00 S 0.00 S 0.00 5 0.00 S OAO $ OAO 0.00 j 0.00 S 0.00 S 0.00 $ 0.00 S x.06 S 0.00 5 0.00 5 O.UO

3 409.18 S b96.86 S Z87.1'I S 4~6.et S 18252 S Y0H.62 3 258.]2 3 218.89 S '181.17 $ 787.89 S 296A9 S 498.17 $ 292.J3 421.2 5 '18284 $ 20858 S 124.88 $ {96.89 S 170,88 S 14240 S 1'17.R~ 5 tO6.M

2461.86 J~84.89 1,988.46 1,6/1.06 7,70126 I.'I~SO7 J207b.28 1.88&]6 1.766.66 1.777.J4 1.297.15 J.23].7J 294572 2.990.7b 1.988.10 2.4128'1 W7.62 20Q1.07 1.eJB.ed 1,B1~A5 7,88272 7.656.29

S 0.00 3 O.OD 5 4.04 $ 0,a~ $ 0.00 5 0.00 $ OAU S 0.00 3 0.00 $ 0.00 $ 0.00 5 0.00 j 0.00 0.00 S 0.00 $ 0.00 S U.00 j 0.00 S OAO 5 0.00 $ 0.00 S x.00

2.461.66 S 3,1&1.89 5 1,886.48 S 3.57L06 S '1.70138 S S,1]S.Ui $ 2,07b.28 $ ~.8H5.]6 $ 1,756.66 S 1.717.J4 5 z.zsr.~s 5 7~77~73 $ z~44.7z 2,990.J6 $ ~~888,l0 ; 3,411.81 S 84],82 $ 2.08.07 S 1.8J9.84 5 ~.BN.OS 5 7.68272 5 1,85639

S U.00 5 U.00 S O.OD 5 0.00 5 OAU S 0.00 S x,00 5 0.00 S 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.00 S 0.00 $ 0.00 ~ 0.00 5 0.00 3 0.00 S 0.90 $ 0.00 S 0.00 S 0.00 S 0.00 5 0,00

2X87.66 3161.88 1,88848 1.b77.08 1701.26 4775.01 4025.28 1885.95 1758.66 1,717.4 4,297.18 ]28973 2944.M 2880.J5 1,888.10 2468.91 847.82 2041.07 1~9~9.84 1,811.05 199272 1866.89

EXHIBIT 1, Page 2 of 3



FAIpBANKS NORTH STAR BOROt10H
7RFn9URYANO 9VDOETONISiON
!OB p10NEER ftOAO
PO 80%i79Z0
FAIpBANK5~A1A5KA CJ707'IJ20
(OBI d6B-0MS .1a~~a~ i~ ~9.

ALCOHOLIC eEVEMaE TA%FFAoiif sQ~

AccawtNa ~iM - ~

8ualoaa X6187NC ~e Mvaev Cmnk Lotlpo ~•

wm. nma rnma or. 6PI41?118 monmly ~portlnp

.o va mtum ~a . =rt a o ew na.omon

No pryme~b
T~tlYe misoelaYleteE
IuamPlNalnfo'mNnh

_NpoRNN aMfdY~tlals

NSF Cryeck

~Otha~ FlBumnvnlld until OT/13He Praviou~lyp Jecled t~ry QiM6H0

Y011RPEPORTHAS 9EIIt FSTIMATE~lW FOLLOWS:

mn e e mn e ma o ma a m~ e a mn o mo e a mn e mn o a ma o e mn a moo ma o aWivn.n. .w~.~nrsen.

A ~un~m~ iwu ta.Mw+ eev+~rw..~ ocrts~

MaY-07 Jun-07 Jub'17 Aug-1) Sap.17 ocbt7 Nov-t7 Dac-17 Jan-t8 Fab-08 Mvr-0e Apt-78 MaY•18 Jul-t9 ~~w rwuw Gmnd Totals

S 14.02A.50 $ 25,71200 5 'IS,B97.OD S ~.~<SAO $ 10.44825 5 17,100.00 S 7.HB5A0 5 12.524.25 S 7'1.992.OD $ 9.908.00 $ 8b7b.7b $ 8,1b0.00 S 14,824.50 5 10,017.50 $ 0.00 5 8.810.00 $ 17,20200 3 8,88B3i ; 4.081.50 S a,esa.00 $ 7b1.821.60

s o.ao $ 0.00 S 0.00 S OAO S 0.00 S 0.00 ; 0.00 S 0.00 5 0.00 S OAU S 0.~~ ; 0.00 S OAO S 0.00 S 0,00 S 0.00 S dU0 = 0.00 5 4.46 S 0.00 5 U.00

14,824.50 25,71200 13691.00 1J.40.R.00 ~O,ddB.16 17,100.00 7.885.00 1251d25 11,39200 9,908.00 8,625.7E 8.'140.00 14,B2d.bU 1U,U1TS0 0.~0 9,810.00 1'1,2820D 8.869.15 4.08150 4,854.00 7H.621.6D

S 74'I.4~ S ~~~85.80 S 779.66 S '1.164.25 j 522.41 S 856.00 $ 58425 5 686.21 5 569.60 S 495.30 5 426.18 5 407.OD j 74133 $ 500.88 5 OAO j 490.60 S d6d t0 1 Ide.4d S 104.60 S ~~2.75 5 ~7.OB4.22

j 0.00 S OAU 5 0.00 S 0.00 $ 0.00 $ U.00 5 0.00 5 0.00 5 O.OD S 0.00 S 0.00 S ~~~~ S 0.00 S 0.00 5 O.UO S D.00 3 0.00 S 0.00 S 0.00 $ O.UO S 0.00

741.2) 1,105.80 779.65 1.16225 5YL.41 855,00 3&1.86 62621 669.60 495.3U d26.28 dU7.00 7b1.27 500.88 0.00 490.60 b6d.70 4d9A6 204.80 2ffi.72 97,481,42

7d.12 118.66 77.96 718.2 5246 85.50 ~e.d] 6262 56.96 49.6 428] 4.70 7A~2 60.08 0.00 49.05 56.dt 41.84 D.00 0.00 1,7t~.J9

5 785.31 5 J21.40 S 784.88 S 290.fi6 S 19U.BU S 2797E S 86.08 5 16&65 j id240 $ 123.89 $ 106.57 5 1U'1.75 3 '185.11 5 12522 S 0.00 S 12288 5 tN.OJ t 0.00 5 OAO $ 0.00 S 9.04&87
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Annmarie Billingsley
Assistant Borough Attorney
Fairbanks North Star Borough
PO Box 71267

i Fairbanks, Alaska 99707
Email: abillingsley@fnsb.us
Ph. (907) 459-1318

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT FOR THE STATE OF ALASKA

FOURTH JUDICIAL DISTRICT AT FAIRBANKS

FAIRBANKS NORTH STAR BOROUGH,

Plaintiff,

vs.
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H54B, INC. dba MOOSE CREEK LODGE
and MELANIE C. JORDAN,

Defendants.

Case No. 4FA-18-01252 CI

ORDER GRANTING FNSB'S MOTION FOR ENTRY OF JUDGMENT AND
ATTORNEY'S FEES

Plaintiff Fairbanks North Star Borough has requested entry of judgment and

attorney's fees against H54B, Inc. dba Moose Creek Lodge and Melanie Caroline

Jordan nka Melanie Caroline White pursuant to the confession of judgment which was

filed on December 12, 2018.

IT IS ORDERED that judgment is hereby entered against the above-named

defendants, H54B, Inc. dba Moose Creek Lodge and Melanie Caroline Jordan nka

Melanie Caroline White.

IT IS ORDERED that the Fairbanks North Star Borough is awarded $4,856.87 in

attorney's fees against Defendants pursuant to Alaska R. Civ. P. 82. Interest shall

Order Granting FNSB's Motion for Attorney's Fees and Entry of Judgment
FNSB v. H54B, lnc. dba Moose Creek Lodge and Melanie C. Jordan; 4FA-18-01252 CI
Page 1 of 2



accrue at the post-judgment rate of 6.0% per annum, pursuant to AS 09.30.070, upon

this amount.

DATED at Fairbanks, Alaska this day of , 2019.

Honorable Randy M. Olsen
Superior Court Judge
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CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE
This is to certify that on this date, a copy
of the foregoing is being:
'mailed via first class mail, o faxed or

❑ hand delivered to the following
attorney or parties of record:

Jason A. Weiner
Gazewood &Weiner, PC
1008 16 h̀ Avenue, Suite 200
Fairbanks, Alaska 99701

FNSB Department of Law

Order Granting FNSB's Motion for Attorney's Fees and Entry of Judgment
FNSB v. H548, Inc. dba Moose Creek Lodge and Melanie C. Jordan; 4FA-18-01252 CI
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IN THE SUPERIOR COURT FOR TI-IE STATE OF ALASKA
FOURTH JUDICIAL DISTRICT AT FAIRBANKS

FAIRBANKS NORTH STAR BOROUGH

Plaintiff,

FE8 15 ?p'g
vs.

H54B, INC. dba MOOSE CREEK LODGE ~„~i
and MELANIE C. JORDAN,

Defendants.
Case No. 4FA-18-01252 CI

OPPOSITION TO MOTION FOR ENTRY OF JUDGMENT AND ATTORNEY'S FEES

H54B, Inc. dba Moose Creels Lodge and Melanie Jordan, by and through undersigned

counsel, hereby oppose the Fairbanks North Star Borough's Motion for Entry of Judgment and

Attorney's Fees.

Defendants have made efforts to make payments. The Borough fails to properly account

for the payments that were made. The Borough also fails to take into account that business has

been stifled at times in the past few years due to water contamination from Eielson Air Force

Base. The Borough allowed the confession of judgment to enter knowing that Defendants were

facing difficulties and were doing what they could to make payments. Defendants are currently

trying to address pollution issues with the United States, and are trying to address what they have

lost due to the contamination.

The Borough has also indicated that it intends to recommend that Defendants' liquor

GAZEWOOD &
WEINER, PC

1008 IG"' Avenue
Suite 200

Fairbanks, Alaska 99701
Tcl.. (907)452-5196
Fay: (907 456-7055

info~fairbanksla~v.com

license not be renewed, and have stated they will protest renewal of the license. How does the

Borough expect Defendants to make payments if they cannot sell alcohol? This was the same

situation that was in place at the commencement of this case —Defendants could not male

1~\513 ~. 1IS~tl3, Inc. db:~ Moose G•ccl:
Lodge, ct al.

Case No. ~1F:~-18-12S2Civil

P~~e 1 013 Opposition to Motion for Entry of
Judgment



payments because an injunction was iii place preventing them from operating. At the same tune,

tl~e Borough was charging Defendants with alcohol sales that never occurred.

Defendants are looking into bankruptcy. While the taxes will need to be paid, the

penalties, interest and attorney fees most likely will be stripped in the banlc~uptcy. Given the

difficult financial climate that has been created due to water issues and transitions at the military

base near the Moose Creels Lodge, Defendants hope the Court will at least give Defendants some

time to put money together the file for bankruptcy.

Finally, attorney fees as calculated by the Borough are not appropriate. The confession

of judgment addresses attorney fees. It states that Plaintiff may collect additional costs and

attorney fees in coruZection with any collection efforts in this matter. The confession of

judgment said nothing about having to pay attorney fees based on Rule 82 for the whole

judgment. If the Borough's motion for entry of judgment is granted, only Rule 82 fees for the

collection efforts after the confession of judgment was entered should be granted, which should

be 20% of their actual fees in filing the motion for entry of judgment, or about $200 at the most.

This Court should deny the Borough's motion for entry of judgment at this time, or at

least should only award fees based on the attorney fees incurred in the filing of the motion for

entry of judgment, not fees based on the entire judgment.

DATED on the 12th day of February, 2019, at Fairbanks, Alaska.

GAZEWO~D & WEINER
Attorneys r Defendants

GAZEWOOD &
WEINER, PC

1008 16°i Avenue
s~~~~e zoo

Fairbanks, Alaska 99701
Tel.: (907)45~_519G
Fas: 1907)496-7053

in fo~fairbankslaw. com

Jason ~ Weider, ABA No, 9906031

I~\'S13 ~. 1IS~tB, tnc. dba ~loosc Crccl;
Lodge, et al.

Case \'v. cif:\-I8-1252Civil

I'a~e 2 0l'3 Opposition to Motion for Gnh•y of
Judgment



ccaT~ric~T~ or s~av~c~
1 hereby certify that a true and correct copy of the foregoing ~a~as
provided via ~ mail Q courier Q hand-delivery to the following:

Fairbanks North Star Borough
Annemarie Billingsley
Department of La~v
P.O. Box 71267
Fairbanks, AK 99707

GAZEWOOD &
WEINER, PC

1008 16'h Avenue
Suite 200

Fairbanks, Alaska 99701
Tel.: (907)45~_t 19G
fax: (907)45G-7055

info a (airbanksla~~~.com

I~N5I3 ~. IISaI3, Inc. dba ~loosc Creel: paoc 3 of3 Opposition to i\Motion 1'or Gnhy of
Li~dac, et aL Judgment
Case Nv. dl~:~-18-12S2Ciri1



IN THE SUPERIOR COURT FOR THE STATE OF ALASKA
FOURTH JUDICIAL DISTRICT AT FAIRBANKS

FAIRBANKS NORTH STAR BOROUGH

Plaintiff,

vs.

H54B, INC. dba MOOSE CREEK LODGE
and MELANIE C. JORDAN,

Defendants.
Case No. 4FA-18-01252 CI

ORDER DENYING MOTION FOR ENTRY OF JUDGMENT AND ATTORNEY FEES

This matter having come before the Court on the Plaintiff's Motion for Entry of

Judgment and Attorney Fees, and having heard Defendant's opposition, and being otherwise

fully advised in the premises;

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that the Plaintiff's Motion for Entry of Judgment and

Attorney Fees is DENIED. Judgment is not entered at this time.

DATED AND ENTERED on the day of , 2019, at Fairbanks, Alaska.

JUDGE OF THE SUPERIOR COURT

GAZEWOOD &
WEINFR. PC

UU8 16'" Avenue

$cite 200
Fairbanks, Alaska 99701

TeL (907)452-5196
Fas; (907)45G-7058

info «+(airbankslaw.com

CGRTIPICATG Of SGRVICG
1 hereby certify that a true and correct copy of the foregoing was
provided via ~ mail Q courier Q hand-delivery to the following:
Fairbanks Nortli Star Borough
Annemarie Billingsley
Department of Law
P.O. Boa 71267
Fairbanks, AK 99707

Dated:G~ a B>-: y

PNSI3 v. HS413, Inc. dba ~\loose Creek
Lodge, et al.

Case No. 4~A-18-12S2Civil

Page I of 1 Order Denying A~lotion 1'or Gnh•y of
Judgment



Annmarie Billingsley 
Assistant Borough Attorney 
Fairbanks North Star Borough 
PO Box 71267 
Fairbanks, Alaska 99707 
Email: abillingsley@fnsb.us 
Ph. (907) 459-1318 

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT FOR THE STATE OF ALASKA 
ldy,___ __ 

FOURTH JUDICIAL DISTRICT AT FAIRBANKS 

FAIRBANKS NORTH STAR BOROUGH, 

Plaintiff, 

vs. 

H54B, INC. dba MOOSE CREEK LODGE 
and MELANIE C. JORDAN, 

Defendants. 

Case No. 4FA-18-01252 Cl 

Fi-1, ii '· '•· 

fourl/1 

FAIRBANKS NORTH STAR BOROUGH'S REPLY TO DEFENDANTS' OPPOSITION 
TO MOTION FOR ENTRY OF JUDGMENT AND ATTORNEY'S FEES 

i( 

The Defendants oppose the entry of judgment because they need time to put 

money together to file for bankruptcy, a bankruptcy that they claim was caused by 

reasons ranging from water contamination issues to transitions at the military base Yet 

the Defendants do not dispute the fact that they signed a confession of judgment that 

they agreed the FNSB would file with the Court. They also do not dispute that they 

agreed that "as a result of such filing, a judgment will be entered and recorded against 

Defendants."1 The Defendants failed to provide any legally supportable argument as to 

why the Court should delay entry of judgment. 

1 See Confession of Judgment at p. 2 (Dec. 12, 2018). 

FNSB's Reply to Defendants' Opposition to Motion for Entry of Judgment and Attorney's Fees 
FNSB v. H54B, Inc. dba Moose Creek Lodge and Melanie C. Jordan; 4FA-18-01252 Cl 
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Instead, the Defendants' Opposition contains a number of wholly unsupported

assertions to which the FNSB lacks even the basic information it would need to

respond. For example, the Defendants claim that the FNSB "fails to properly account

for the payments that were made."2 The FNSB attached an Exhibit to its Motion for

Entry of Judgment which shows the payments being applied in a spreadsheet, contains

a narrative showing the dates that payments were received, and explains the manner in

which they were applied.3 If the Defendants truly believed that the FNSB failed to

properly account of payments, they should have, at the very least, explained how.

Similarly, the Defendants claim that the FNSB was charging the Defendants with

alcohol sales that never occurred while there was an injunction in place.4 The

Defendants raised this issue on November 2, 2018 in an e-mail through counsel. The

FNSB responded, "[t]he last time your client was issued a notice to quit operations, she

continued operating anyway....IF she had no income, she still needs to file the report.

~ The injunction is not a valid excuse and based on her past performance, isn't a reliable

indicator that she had zero sales....lf the June and July estimates have not been

finalized yet, she should send in her reports ASAP."5 A month later, the Defendants

submitted their reports for June and July 2018, the time period when the injunction was

in place.6 The FNSB updated its spreadsheet and only charged the Defendants for the

sales they reported.' The Defendants are intentionally misleading the Court.

Finally, the Defendants object to the entry of Rule 82 attorney fees. The

2 See Defendants' Opposition to Motion for Entry of Judgment and Attorney's Fees at p. 1 (Feb. 12, 2019)
hereinafter "Opposition").
See Exhibit 1 to the Motion for Entry of Judgment and Attorney's Fees at p. 1 (Jan. 30, 2019).

4 Opposition at pp. 1-2.
5 See November 2, 2018 e-mail chain, attached as Exhibit 1.
6 See December 11, 2018 e-mail, attached as Exhibit 2.
~ See Exhibit 1 to the Motion for Entry of Judgment and Attorney's Fees at p. 3 (Jan. 30, 2019).

FNSB's Reply to Defendants' Opposition to Motion for Entry of Judgment and Attorney's Fees
FNSB v. H548, Inc. dba Moose Creek Lodge and Melanie C. Jordan; 4FA-18-01252 CI
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Defendants are correct that the confession of judgment addresses attorney fees. It

specifically says, "[I]n the event of Defendants' default, Plaintiff may also collect any

additional costs and attorney fees incurred in connection with any collection efforts in

this matter."$ The Defendants interpret the attorney fees provision in the confession of

~ judgment to apply only to collection efforts after the confession of judgment was

entered. This is incorrect and there is no limiting language in the provision to support

this interpretation. Instead the provision contains the expansive modifier "any" and

allows the FNSB to collect "any" attorney fees incurred in connection with "any"

collection efforts in this matter. Since the Defendants' defaulted, the FNSB is entitled to

all of its attorney fees. If the Defendants prefer to pay the actual attorney fees incurred

in connection with the collection efforts in this matter, the FNSB is not opposed. The

actual attorney fees total $8,481.52.9

DATED this 22"d day of February, 2019.

FAIRBANKS NORTH STAR BOROUGH

Annmarie Billingsley
Assistant Borough Attorney
Alaska Bar No. 1011059

I CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE
This is to certify that on this date, a copy
of the foregoing is being:
❑ mailed via first class mail, a faxed or
❑ hand delivered to the following
attorney or parties of record:

Jason A. Weiner
Gazewood &Weiner, PC
1008 16~h Avenue, Suite 200
Fairbanks, Alaska 99701

FNSB Department of Law Date

8 See Confession of Judgment at p. 3 (Dec. 12, 2018).
9 See Itemization of Time, attached as Exhibit 3.

FNSB's Reply to Defendants' Opposition to Motion for Entry of Judgment and Attorney's Fees
FNSB v. H548, Inc. dba Moose Creek Lodge and Melanie C. Jordan; 4FA-18-01252 CI
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Kimberly Pan

From: Annmarie Billingsley

Sent: Friday, November 02, 2018 2:07 PM

To: Jason Weiner

Cc: Kimberly Pan

Subject: RE: Moose Creek Lodge

Hi Jason,

I'm happy to hear that your surgery went smoothly, but sorry that you had to have surgery at all and that the recovery

hasn't been great.

The last time your client was issued a notice to quit operations, she continued operating anyway. FNSBC 8,52,100(6)

specifically says "Every seller possessing a current certificate of registration shall file with the borough a properly

completed monthly report form no later than the fifteenth day of the month following the month subject to the report

even if the seller has not engaged in taxable retail sales during the reported month." IF she had no income, she still

needs to file the report. The injunction is not a valid excuse and based on her past performance, isn't a reliable indicator

that she had zero sales. Further, the FNSB only had to get the injection because had been indebted to the FNSB for over

four years and then she ceased all communication and ignored all of the correspondence and communication attempts

that the FNSB had been making prior to the litigation, If the June and July estimates have not been finalized yet, she

should send in her reports ASAP.

We have pre-trial deadlines coming up on 11/27 so if your client is going to sign the confession of judgment, please get

any edits back to me ASAP so that we can get it filed before then.

Thanks,

Annmarie

Annmarie Billingsley
Assistant Borough Attorney
Fairbanks North Star Borough
P.O. Box 71267
Fairbanks, AK 99707
(907) 459-1318

This message contains information that is confidential and within the Attorney-Client or Attorney Work Product

privilege. Disclosure of its contents to third persons will adversely affect Borough interests and is prohibited by FNSB

2.25.140. If this message is received by someone other than the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any

disclosure, copying, distribution, or use of the information contained herein (including any reliance thereon) is STRICTLY

PROHIBITED. If you received this transmission in error, please immediately contact the sender and destroy the material

in its entirety, whether in electronic or hard copy format. This communication is also covered by the Electronic

Communications Privacy Act, 18 USC 2510, et seq.

DO N07 FORV1/ARD 'PHIS E-M,41L without fir~f discussing the consequences of such action with the sender.

From: Jason Weiner [mailto:jweiner@fairbankslaw.com]
Sent: Friday, November 02, 2018 3:26 AM
To: Annmarie Billingsley
Cc: Kimberly Pan
Subject: RE: Moose Creek Lodge

i

Exhibit 1, Page 1 of 2



have been just catching up after gall bladder surgery. Surgery was short and sweet, but the pre and post weeks were

not much fun.

Melanie wanted to point out that the Borough closed her down in June and July with the injunction, so there was no

income. In fact, there was a lot of loss. She should not be charged nor should she have to produce reports for those

months.

Jason

From: Annmarie Billingsley [mailto:ABillingsley@fnsb.us]
Sent: Monday, October 15, 2018 3:57 PM
To: Jason Weiner
Cc: Kimberly Pan
Subject: RE: Moose Creek Lodge

H i Jason,
confirmed with Treasury and Budget that they did in fact receive a $3,000 check from Melanie. However, they did not

receive reports for June and July. As such the spreadsheet attached to the Draft Confession of Judgment still has

estimates. I'm unclear on whether the 30 day appeal period has run such that those estimates have been finalized, but

nevertheless, I included the estimates with the past due amounts instead of with the current accounting so that your

clients wouldn't have such a large current balance to pay off immediately.

Please review the attached Draft and let me Know if it's amenable to your clients.

Thanks,
Annmarie

Annmarie Billingsley
Assistant Borough Attorney
Fairbanks North Star Borough
P.O. Box 71267
Fairbanks, AK 99707
(907) 459-1318

This message contains information that is confidential and within the Attorney-Client or Attorney Work Product
privilege. Disclosure of its contents to third persons will adversely affect Borough interests and is prohibited by FNSB
2.25.140. If this message is received by someone other than the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any
disclosure, copying, distribution, or use of the information contained herein (including any reliance thereon) is STRICTLY
PROHIBITED. If you received this transmission in error, please immediately contact the sender and destroy the material
in its entirety, whether in electronic or hard copy format. This communication is also covered by the Electronic
Communications Privacy Act, 18 USC 2510, et seq.

DO PJOT FORWARD "PHIS E-MAIL without first discussing the consequences of such action with the sender.

From: Jason Weiner [mailto:jweiner@fairbankslaw.com]
Sent: Tuesday, October 09, 2018 4:53 PM
To: Annmarie Billingsley
Cc: Jessica Richards
Subject: RE: Moose Creek Lodge

My understanding is that Melanie has dropped off a check for $3,000. Do you want to prepare the confession of

judgment?

Jason
2
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Kimberly Pan

From: Kimberly Pan
Sent: Tuesday, December 11, 2018 3:07 PM
To: 'Jessica Richards'
Cc: 'abender@fairbankslaw.com'
Subject: Moose Creek Lodge -filing for June 2018
Attachments: June 2018 filing.pdf

Good afternoon,

We received an email from you on November 21 with photos of the signed tax documents (attached, p. 1). We then
received the original signed tax documents by courier on December 5 (attached, p. 2). The amount of sales on the
emailed June 2018 filing was $10,017.50 and a total tax due of $500.88. The original document we received for the June

2018 filing showed total sales of $10,075.50, a tax of $500,85 (should be $503.78), and is dated December 3, 2018.

Please clarify why the documents we received for the June 2018 filing are different.

Thank you,

Kimberly S. Pan
Legal Assistant
Fairbanks North Star Borough
Department of Law
P.O. Box 71267
Fairbanks, Alaska 99707
(907) 459-131 ~/p
(907) 459-1155/f
Email:kpan@fnsb.us

i
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ITEMIZATION OF ATTORNEY'S FEES

ATTORNEY TIME ($250/HR)
DATE HRS ACTIVITY INITIALS TOTAL
8/1/17 0.5 Meeting with Treasury/Budget to discuss AB $125.00

foreclosin on sales tax liens
8/7/17 0.25 Conference with AF re: communications with AB $62.50

alcoholic beverage control board and owed
alcohol taxes. Review e-mail corres ondence

8/9/17 2.0 Review Moose Creek sales tax lien and AB $500.00
corresponding case law. Send e-mail to
Treasury/Budget re: need to revise lien and file
suit

9/5/17 0.25 e-mails/discussion with JD re: approval to file AB $62.50
suit

9/7/17 0.5 Meeting with Treasury/Budget re: AB $125.00
documentation needed to file suit

9/11/17 0.25 Conference w/ KP re: drafting demand letter AB $62.50
and where to send it

9/18/17 0.25 review demand letter and conference w/ KP re: AB $62.50
re uestin total amounts due

11/6/17 .0.5 Receive confirmation from Treasury/Budget AB $125.00
that no payments were made. Request updated
amounts as of 11/15. Meeting with KP re:
draftin com taint

12/11/17 1.5 Telephone call with Treasury/Budget re: AB $375.00
requested relief options including injunction.
Send follow up e-mail recapping conversation
and rovidin code references

12/18/18 0.25 Amend alcoholic beverage tax lien and give to AB $62.50
KP for recordin

1/4/18 0.5 Conference w/ KP re: exhibits needed and AB $125.00
estimated taxes letter

1/5/18 0.2 Review/edit estimated taxes letter. Conference AB $50.00
w/ KP re: status of com taint

1/12/18 2.0 Edit and supplement Complaint. Conference w/ AB $500.00
KP. Review e-mails to Treasury/Budget re:
when business started o eratin

1/16/18 0.5 Review summons, complaint, case description AB $125.00
and review/si n com taint for filin

1/16/18 0.2 E-mails to JD re: notifying assembly of non- AB $50.00
routine liti ation/'udicial assi nment,

2/21/18 1.5 Review draft default motion, order, and AB $375.00
affidavit. Be in makin edits

Exhibit 3, Page 1 of 5



2/22/18 0.5 Read and review notice of change of contact AB $125.00
info and motion for extension of time.
Conference w /KP re: draftin limited o osition

2/23/18 0.2 Review and sign limited opposition to extension AB $50.00
of time

3/15/18 0.2 Conference w/mayor's office re: protesting AB $50.00
l i uor license if liti ation on oin

3/22/28 0.2 Read and review order denying defendant's AB $50.00
motion for extension of time

3/29/18 1.0 Conference w/ KP re: moving forward with AB $250.00
default. Review draft motion and affidavit. Track
chap es.

5/4/18 0.5 Conference w/ JD re: filin default AB $125.00
5/11/18 1.0 Review and sign affidavit and request for entry AB $250.00

of default. Review and edit order and default
'ud ement/in'unction

5/30/18 0.1 r/r EOA b Weiner AB $25.00
6/15/18 0.2 r/r Answer to Com taint AB $50.00
6/21/18 0.1 r/r order granting default and injunction and AB $25.00

deficienc memo from Court
6/21/18 0.2 Review final 'udgment. Conference w/KP AB $50.00
6/25/18 0.5 Review e-mails from Weiner/JD re: expedited AB $125.00

and lifting the injunction. Review e-mails from
JD to client re: ro osed course of action

7/9/18 0.2 Review motion for expedited and corresponding AB $50.00
order and affidavits Review underlying motion
for reconsideration and Answer to Com taint.

7/9/18 0.6 Review unopposed motion for extension of AB $150.00
time. Conference w/JD recapping TC with
Weiner. Conference w/KP re: exhibits needed

7/12/18 2.7 Research and Draft Opposition to Defendants' AB $675.00
Motion to Set Aside Ent of Default

7/18/18 0.2 r/r reply to opposition to set aside default, AB $50.00
acce t late answer, and set aside in'unction

8/1/18 0.1 Conference w/KP re: flagging license renewal. AB $25.00
R/r attorne 's re uest for hearin

8/2/18 0.1 r/r order rantin motion to set aside, etc. AB $25.00
8/13/18 0.1 r/r e-mail from Weiner re: settlement ro osal AB $25.00
8/22/18 1.4 Attending TDSC. Review settlement proposal AB $350.00

from Weiner. E-mail client offer and
assessment and re uest feedback

8/23/18 0.1 Review retrial order AB $25.00
9/4/18 0.6 r/r e-mail from Weiner re: $51 K offer. E-mails AB $150.00

with clients re: ro osed res onse
9/10/18 0.2 Conference w/KP re: preliminary witness list. AB $50.00

Review and si n.

Exhibit 3, Page 2 of 5



9/17/18 0.1 Review amended retrial order AB $25.00
9/19/18 0.3 e-mails from Weiner &clients negotiating

settlement terms
AB $75.00

9/27/18 0.2 e-mail to Weiner final settlement terms AB $50.00
10/10/18 0.2 Conference w/AF re: drafting confession of

judgment. E-mails with Weiner. Conference
w/KP.

AB $50.00

10/23/18 0.2 e-mails w/T/B re: applying payments and
revisin s readsheet

AB $50.00

1 1/2/18 0.2 5x e-mails with Weiner AB $50.00
11/19/18 0.1 Review and si n witness list. AB $25.00
11/28/18 0.3 5x e-mails with Jessica Richards re: confession

of judgments and outstanding reports.
Conference w/KP re: discovery deadline.
Follow u on status of confession.

AB $75.00

11/29/18 0.1 Review Defendant's Witness list AB $25.00
12/7/18 0.2 Sign confession of judgment. Conference w/KP

re: filin and circulatin
AB $50.00

12/10/18 0.1 Review and si n motion to vacate trial AB $25.00
12/28/18 0.2 Get update from T/B review and conference

w/KP re: letter to Weiner
AB $50.00

1/9/18 0.1 Review order rantin motion to vacate AB $25.00
1/30/18 0.4 Edit Motion for Entry of Judgment. Conference

w/KP. Review final judgment, cost bills, and
affidavit. Review and si n letter to Weiner

AB $100.00

2/15/18 0.1 r/r O osition to motion for entr of 'ud ment. AB $25.00
2/21/18 2.3 Draft re I too for ent of 'ud ment AB $575.00

TOTAL: $6,812.50

PARALEGAL TIME ($125/HR)
DATE HRS ACTIVITY INITIALS TOTAL

9/18/17 0.25 Begin drafting demand letter for alcoholic
bevera e taxes

KP $31.25

11/16/17 0.75 Be in draftin com taint KP $93.75
12/18/17 0.25 Prepare Corrected Notice of Alcoholic

Bevera e Tax Lien for recordin
KP $31.25

1/5/18 0.25 Begin drafting letter to Moose Creek regarding
u dated estimated taxes due

KP $31.25

1/11/18 1.0 Continue draftin com taint KP $125.00
1/12/18 0.5 Continue draftin com taint KP $62.50
1/16/18 0.5 Review summons, complaint, and case

descri tion for filin
KP $62.50

2/21/18 1.5 Begin drafting request for default judgment,
ro osed order, default 'ud ment, and affidavit

KP $187.50
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2/23/18 0.5 Begin drafting Plaintiff's Limited Opposition to KP $62.50
Defendants' Motion for Extension of Time and
finalize for filin

3/29/18 0.5 Continue draftin re uest for default 'ud ment KP $62.50
5/9/18 0.5 Continue draftin re uest for default 'ud ment KP $62.50
5/11/18 0.75 Review and finalize request for default KP $93.75

'ud ment and su ortin documents for filin
6/21/18 0.25 Draft ro osed Final Jud ment KP $31.25
7/3/18 0.5 Begin drafting Motion for Extension of Time to KP $62.50

File Opposition to Defendants' Motion to Set
Aside Ent of Default

7/5/18 0.25 Review Motion for Extension of Time to File KP $31.25
Opposition to Defendants' Motion to Set Aside
Entry of Default for filing and email to Jason
Weiner

7/5/18 0.25 Begin drafting Opposition to Defendants' KP $31.25
Motion to Set Aside Ent of Default

7/11/18 0.5 Review Opposition to Defendants' Motion to KP $62.50
Set Aside Entry of Default and prepare exhibits
for filin

8/23/18 0.5 Review retrial order and calendar deadlines KP $62.50
9/4/18 0.25 Draft Prelimina Witness List KP $31.25
10/10/18 0.5 Draft Confession of Jud ment AF $62.50
10/10/18 0.25 Review Confession of Jud ment KP $31.25
10/23/18 0.25 Draft letter to Jason Weiner re ardin re orts KP $31.25
1 1/19/18 0.25 Draft La Witness List KP $31.25
11/20/18 0.1 Email Monthly Reporting Forms to Jason KP $12.50

Weiner's office
11/27/18 0.25 Revise Confession of Judgment with new KP $31.25

amounts and email to Jason Weiner's office
12/3/18 0.1 Email Jason Weiner's office regarding status of KP $12.50

the Confession of Jud ment
12/10/18 0.25 Draft Motion to Vacate Trial KP $31.52
12/11/18 0.1 Email Jason Weiner's office regarding different KP $12.50

tax documents received
12/14/18 0.1 Email Jason Weiner regarding payment KP $12.50

deadline
12/28/18 0.1 Draft letter to Jason Weiner regarding KP $12.50

a menu
1/8/19 0.75 Draft Motion for Ent of Jud ment KP $93.75
1/30/19 0.5 Review Motion for Ent of Jud ment for filin KP $62.50
1/30/19 0.1 Draft letter to Jason Weiner regarding missed KP $12.50

a ment
TOTAL: $1,669.02
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TOTAL OF ATTORNEY AND PARALEGAL TIME:
$6812.50 + $1669.02 = $8,481.52
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