
Department of Commerce, Community, 
and Economic Development 

ALCOHOL & MARIJUANA CONTROL OFFICE 

550 West Seventh Avenue, Suite 1600 
Anchorage, Alaska 99501 

Main: 907.269.0350 

MEMORANDUM 

          TO: Marijuana Control Board DATE: Tuesday, January 04, 2022 

          FROM: Jason M Davies CJTII RE:Responses to NOV for Renewal Applications  

Marijuana Licensing received written responses to past notice of violations due the renewal process of 
marijuana licenses.   

     Below is the list of licensees who have responded along with their responses.  

Notice of Violations with Responses regarding the MJ-20 renewal application 

License  DBA 

10063  Bob’s Morning Bear Cultivation 

10657  JWS Enterprises 

10958  Green Life Supply 

13785  Alaskan Pharms LLC 

Thank you, 

Jason M Davies, CJTII 



Greener Consulting Group LLC

To:Daniel Hall, AMCO
From:Brennan Norden
Subject:NOV response for 10063 license renewal
Date:10-26-2021

Daniel,
Brennan Norden did not have any excise tax burden at Bob’s Morning Bear but
didn’t realize that he needed to file a zero with the revenue department every
month to keep his account in good standing.  Brennan has backfilled the delinquent
months and is compliant with the department at this time.  In regards to the NOV
from AMCO this was a clerical error and has been remedied.

Please call with any questions.

Thanks,

Justin Jones
Greener Consulting Group
303-257-6040

__________________________________________________________________________
Greener Consulting Group, LLC 707-496-0228 Oklahoma City, OK

AMCO received 10/26/2021

10063 - Bob's Morning Bear Cultivation MJ-20 Response 



Notice of Violation

Date: 
Designated Licensee:
DBA: 

License #/Type:

AMCO Case#:

This is a notice to you as licensee that an alleged violation has occurred. If the Marijuana Control Board decides to act against your
license, under the provisions of AS 44.62.330 - AS 44.62.630 (Administrative Procedures Act) you will receive an Accusation and 
Notice of your right to an Administrative Hearing.

Note: This is not an accusation or a criminal complaint.

Issuing Investigator:  Received by: 

SIGNATURE: SIGNATURE:

Delivered VIA: Date:  

Premises Address:

Mailing Address:

2/18/21 10063 Limited Cultivation

Brennan J Norden
BOB'S MORNING BEAR CULTIVATION

21725 Evelyn May St Kasilof, AK 99610

PO Box 1205 Kasilof, AK 99610

As of 2/17/21, Bob's Morning Bear Cultivation, 10063, Limited Cultivation, you were delinquent on
your marijuana excise tax liability.

You have 30 days to resolve this matter with the Department of Revenue. If the delinquency is not
resolved, an accusation may be brought to the Marijuana Control Board.

Your attention is directed to: AS 17.38.010(b)(2) legitimate, taxpaying business people, and not
criminal actors, will conduct sales of marijuana; 3 AAC 306.480. Marijuana tax to be paid; 3 AAC
306.810. Suspension or revocation of license; AS 43.61.030(b). Marijuana cultivation facility fails to
pay tax; AS 43.05.230(e) DOR can publish list of taxpayer(s) who failed to pay their taxes.; 15 AAC
61.020. License revocation and suspension.

J. Hoelscher

Email









To Whom It May Concern

Re: AMCO Notice of Violation

Sept 29,2021


Letter of Explanation, Notice of Violation License #10657 

Notice of Violation, 4/29/21


This NOV was in response to an underpaid tax payment for Lic# 10657.  The amount paid was 
short by $23 and change, an accounting error.  The amount has been rectified and fully paid.


Notice of Violation, 6/16/21


This NOV is in response to a late tax payment for Lic#10657.  The amount has since been fully 
paid.

10657 - JWS Enterprises MJ-20 Response





Note: This is not an accusation or a criminal complaint.



Note: This is not an accusation or a criminal complaint.



Received by AMCO 6.28.21

10958 - Green Life Supply MJ-20 Response



Received by AMCO 6.28.21



Received by AMCO 6.28.21



Received by AMCO 6.28.21



Received by AMCO 6.28.21



Received by AMCO 6.28.21



Received by AMCO 6.28.21



Received by AMCO 6.28.21



From: John Wright
To: Marijuana Licensing (CED sponsored)
Cc: Brenda Butler
Subject: Alaskan Pharms #13785
Date: Friday, October 22, 2021 3:43:44 PM
Attachments: Dept of Revenue payoff notices Alaskan Pharms.PDF

Up dated AMCO MJ-20 John.PDF
Up dates Amco MJ-20 REGINA.PDF
AMCO $200.00 refund 10 2021.PDF
Tax MOs for Sept 2021 and October monthly payment.PDF

Hello Mr. Hall.
I have attached the notices from Alaska Dept. of Revenue, showing no amounts due for the dates
stated on the NOV's. All have been paid.
I am presently in a payment program with the Dept. of Revenue and all payments have been and
are current.
I understand the importance of keeping current with our tax obligations and have caught up and
will no longer have to play catch up, but will be able to stay in a positive status with the tax office
and AMCO.
Thank you, for working with us thru these times.
Attached are: 
1. Notice from Dept of Revenue, payed in full for NOV dates.
2. Receipts showing taxes paid for September 2021 and monthly install payment.
3. Up dated MJ-20's. for Regina and john, myself.
4. Signature sheet for 200 dollar refund.
Thank you
John Wright

13785 Alaskan Pharms LLC MJ-20 Response













Note: This is not an accusation or a criminal complaint.



Hi Mr. Davies. 
The balances due shown are part of the payment plan I've had with the revenue dept. for almost the whole last year. 
Have not missed a payment. 
There are only three payments remaining on the agreement. $790.00/mth is what is paid. 
All other taxes are up to date. 
Thank you, 
Hope you are doing well. 
John. 

.





Note: This is not an accusation or a criminal complaint.



Note: This is not an accusation or a criminal complaint.



Good Morning Mr. Davies. 
Here are the receipts and tracking number showing the delinquent amount has been sent to Dept. of Revenue. 
I will send a screenshot when it is posted on their site. 
Thank you, 
John Wright 
Alaskan Pharms 












